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OCT 24 2016

REQUEST FOR AGENDA PLACEMENT FORM
Submission Deadline - Tuesday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates

SUBMITTED BY: Ralph McBroom
TODAY’S DATE: October 7, 2016

DEPARTMENT: Purchasing

DEPARTMENT HEAD: Ralph McBroom

REQUESTED AGENDA DATE: October 24, 2016

SPECIFIC AGENDA WORDING: Consider and approve award of RFB 2016-
611 Road Signs and Markers to Custom Products Corporation.

PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM: Ralph McBroom

SUPPORT MATERIAL: See attachment

TIME: 5 min ACTIONITEM: X
WORKSHOP:
CONSENT:
EXECUTIVE:

STAFF NOTICE:

COUNTY ATTORNEY: IT DEPARTMENT:

AUDITOR: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT:

PERSONNEL: PUBLIC WORKS:

BUDGET COORDINATOR: OTHER:

kkkkkkkkk**This Section to be Completed by County Judge’s Office******&* k%

ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE:

REQUEST RECEIVED BY COUNTY JUDGE’S OFFICE

COURT MEMBER APPROVAL —___Date




Approved

Commissioners Court
RFB 2016-611 Road Signs 0CT 24 2016
Custom Products Pathmark
. ¢ Road ¢
. Road Sign Required Vendor . Road Sign Required Vendor .
Size and Only, Size and Only, ) . . X Size and Only
. o Hardware Delivery in | Delivery time Total Descrioti pri , Hardware Delivery in | Delivery time Total Description Prism
Description v:mBmgn Estimated 12 days in days escription :m:_mzn Estimated 12 days in days p o ”.
Sheeting Month usage Sheeting Month usage eet
(each) (each)
per each per each per ez
i 12inch x 18
12 _ﬂ”:x 81 ¢610 $0.86 90 5-10days | 5-10days | $ sa0.00] ¥ _ﬁw:x 181 ¢0.09 No Bid 50 5-10 days 10 $ 899.10 il $12.¢
- 12 inch x 36
12 _M_M:x 36 1 41150 $0.86 90 5-10days | 5-10days |$ 1,035.00f 12 _ﬁwsx 36 1 41399 | Nosid 90 5-10 days 10 $ 1259100 “ 7 $25.¢
: . 18inch x 24 )
18 _“_M:x 21 e11s0 $0.86 72 5-10days | 5-10days | $ g28.00] 28 _ﬂw:x 21 41399 | Nosid 72 5-10 days 10 $ 1,007.28 ﬂ%x $25.;
i i 24 inch x 24
24 _ﬂw:x 241 41510 $0.86 110 5-10days | 5-10days | $ 1e6100] 2 _ﬂwrx 241 1899 | NoBid 110 5-10 days 10 $ 2,088.90 _ﬂ%x $33.:
. . inchx 3
30 _ﬂw:x 01 2350 $0.86 75 5-10days | 5-10days | $ 1,76250] ¥ _M_H:x 301 5899 No Bid 75 5-10 days 10 $ 2174250 ¥ _ﬂnzx O ¢ass
. . inch
30inchx 60 | ¢47 00 $1.72 0 10-15days| 5-10days | $ . 30inchx80 | o500 No Bid 0 10-15 days 15 $ LJ 30inchx60 | oy0e,
inch inch inch
30inch i i
inch Stop | 455 40 $0.86 84 5-10days | 5-10days | $ 188160 | 30MhStoP | w3000 | Nosid 84 5-10 days 15 $ 2,016.00] 30NChSOP | oo
Sign Sign Sign
6inchx 18 Binchx 18 6inchx 18
inch Street $9.05 $3.50 121 10-15days| 5-10days | $ 1,095.05 § inch Street $5.99 No Bid 121 10-15 days 15 S 724.79] inch Street $8.7
Sign Sign Sign
6inchx 24 6inch x 24 6inch x 24
inch Street $12.06 $3.50 99 10-15days| 5-10days | $ 1,193.94 § inch Street $7.49 No Bid 99 10-15 days 15 S 741.51] inch Street $11.7
Sign Sign Sign
6inch x 36 6inch x 36 6inchx 36
inch STREET | $18.09 $3.50 4 10-15 days| S5-10days | $ 72.36 ] inch STREET | $11.18 No Bid 4 10-15 days 15 $ 44.72 | inch STREET |  $21.;
SIGN SIGN SIGN
Total $ 10,078.45 $ 10,955.65




Total

$ 1,158.30

$ 2,338.20

S 1,817.28

$ 3,665.20

$ 3,639.00

$ 4,810.68

$ 1,062.38

$ 1,158.30

$ 84.96

$ 19,734.30




